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Mr. Podojil called the meeting to order at 7:00 pm. Board members Ms. Rader and 
Mr. Gerard were also present. 
 
MINUTES: Ms. Rader made the motion to approve the minutes from the 511 Park 
Board regular meeting held on September 22, 2016, as presented. Mr. Gerard 
seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.  
 
Mr. Podojil asked if once the minutes are approved if they would be provided on 
the Township Website, if they will be sent to the library, and how else they will be 
available to the public. The minutes will be on the Township website once they are 
approved since the 511 Board is an extension of the Trustees, the minutes will be 
sent to the library, and there will be a copy in the Administration Building for 
public view.  
 
The Board discussed the Report that is being put together. The report needs to be 
done by December and provided to the Trustees by January 2017. There are 
going to be four general areas to the report that will include a mission statement, 
goals, land acquisitions and opportunities, and financials. The Board divided the 
sections amongst themselves so they can start to write them. The board would 
like a draft of everyone's sections by the next meeting for discussion and input 
from the rest of the board. Mr. Gerard will write about the introduction, mission, 
and goals. Ms. Rader will put together bylaws. Mr. Podojil will look into land 
acquisition and opportunities.  
 
The Board asked if they could be provided with the definitions of the zoning 
districts in Russell Township. Ms. Dorka will follow up. 
 
COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC WERE RECEIVED 
 
EXECUTIVE SESSION: Mr. Podojil made the motion to move into executive 
session to discuss the purchase of land , pursuant to ORC 121.22 (G) (2). Mr. 
Gerard seconded the motion and it passed unanimously.   
 
The meeting moved into executive session at 7:49 pm. 
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Mr. Gerard made the motion to return to regular session. Ms. Rader seconded the 
motion and it passed unanimously. 
 
The meeting moved into regular session at 8:32 pm 
 
Ms. Rader made the motion to adjourn. Mr. Gerard seconded and it passed 
unanimously.   
 
The meeting was adjourned at 8:32 pm. 
 
 
 
___________________ 
Roy Podojil, Chairman     
 
      __________________ 

Recorded by: J. Dorka 


